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On 14 November 2001, the Minister of State and Federal Government
Commissioner for Cultural and Media Affairs presented a new film policy. He
intends to reform film production aid and to ensure that German films are
classified as cultural assets. This should help German films to attain a bigger
market share in Germany and Europe and ensure that more German films are
featured at international festivals.

The main points of the proposed policy can be divided into five sections.
Incentives for the economic success of film productions (section 1), the legal
framework for artistic creativity (section 2) and the distribution of German films
abroad (section 3) should all be strengthened and improved. In addition,
independent film producers should be given a more prominent role as key players
in the film industry (section 4) and the cultural value of German and European
films in general should be more widely recognised (section 5). Practical
suggestions include, for example, as far as screenplays are concerned, a
mentoring system and a new type of initial aid. However, this reform of film policy
is merely a proposal, to be discussed in greater detail with players in the film
industry in preparation for the amended Filmförderungsgesetz (Film Production
Aid Act), which is due to be adopted in 2003.

Filmpolitisches Konzept: Vorschläge zur Reform der Filmförderung und
zur Aufwertung des deutschen Films als Kulturgut des Beauftragten der
Bundesregierung für Angelegenheiten der Kultur und der Medien
Staatsminister Prof. Dr. Julian Nida-Rümelin, November 2001

http://www.filmfoerderung-bkm.de/internet/03politik/31.htm

Proposals of the Minister of State and Federal Government Commissioner for
Cultural and Media Affairs for a new film policy of November 2001

http://www.filmfoerderung-bkm.de/internet/03politik/bilder/Enlische_Version.pdf
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